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Samantha C. Lowe, MD, Pediatrician with White Plains
Hospital
Get to know Pediatrician Dr. Samantha C. Lowe, who serves the population of New York.

New York, Feb 22, 2019 (Issuewire.com)  -  Dr Lowe was an Associate Member of the Medical Staff in
the Department of Pediatrics/Emergency Medicine at St. Barnabas Hospital and an Associate Professor
in the Department of Pediatrics at Albert Einstein College of Medicine in Bronx, NY. She currently
practices as a Pediatrician with White Plains Hospital.
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White Plains Hospital is a leading healthcare provider in Westchester County and home to many
renowned programs and services. The Hospital offers much of the technology and specialty care usually
found at large teaching hospitals and combines it with compassionate care close to home.

Dr Lowe holds expertise in providing routine and emergency care to infants, children, and adolescents.
She provides pediatric general physicals, immunizations, sick visits, and urgent care visits. Dr Lowe is
certified by the American Board of Pediatrics. To stay up to date in her field she was inducted as a
Fellow of the American Academy of Pediatrics. Physicians who maintain their Fellow of the American
Academy of Pediatrics designation make an ongoing commitment to lifelong learning and advocacy for
children.

Dr Lowe graduated with her Medical Degree from SUNY Downstate College of Medicine in Brooklyn,
NY. After obtaining her Medical Degree. After obtaining her medical degree she completes her
internship and residency in paediatrics at NYU School of Medicine in New York, NY.

Paediatrics is the branch of medicine dealing with the health and medical care of infants, children, and
adolescents from birth up to the age of 18. A paediatrician is a children’s physician who provides
medical care to children who are acutely or chronically ill, as well as preventive health services to
healthy children. They manage the physical, mental, and emotional well-being of the children under their
care at every stage of development, in both sickness and health.

Learn More about Dr Samantha C. Lowe: 

Through her findatopdoc profile,
https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/974725-Samantha-Lowe-Bronx-NY-10457 Her profile with White
Plains Hospital, https://www.wphphysicianassociates.org/doctors/dr-samantha-c-lowe-md/ she can be
contacted at (914) 849-7999 and is located in Armonk, NY.

About FindaTopDoc.com

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide on you your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know how to make informed decisions for you and your family.

Media Contact

FindATopDoc

sarah@findatopdoc.com

Source : Samantha C. Lowe, MD

https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/974725-Samantha-Lowe-Bronx-NY-10457
https://www.wphphysicianassociates.org/doctors/dr-samantha-c-lowe-md/


Issuewire
www.Issuewire.com

See on IssueWire : https://www.issuewire.com/samantha-c-lowe-md-pediatrician-with-white-plains-
hospital-1626190444102589
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