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Brian E. Jackson, DDS, a Dentist with Brian Jackson Dental
Get to know Dentist Dr. Brian E. Jackson, who serves patients in Willoughby Hills, Ohio.

New York City, Aug 16, 2019 (Issuewire.com)  -  With over 25 years of experience, Dr. Jackson is a
dentist who is currently serving patients’ dental needs at his private dental practice, Brian Jackson
Dental in Willoughby Hills, Ohio. The professional team at Brian Jackson Dental is dedicated to
achieving excellence in dentistry through individual quality care. They aim to help create beautiful
smiles, provide a positive experience for patients of all ages, and establish long-lasting relationships
with each and every patient driven by trust, comfort, and respect. Brian Jackson Dental creates the
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function and esthetics for a great foundation of oral health today and for the future.

Dr. Jackson earned his Bachelor of Arts degree in zoology from Miami University. In 1991, he earned
his Doctor of Dental Surgery degree from the Ohio State University College of Dentistry. Thereafter, he
went on to complete his residency at the Medical College of Ohio.

Dr. Jackson is a member of the Ohio Dental Association, the American Dental Association, and the
Greater Cleveland Dental Society. He is also a Fellow of the International College of Oral
Implantologists. Dr. Jackson was voted Cleveland Top Dentist by Cleveland Magazine in 2018.
Additionally, Dr. Jackson attributes his success to his love for dentistry, his ability to provide quality
patient care, his strive to continually make a difference, as well as having a great team of staff
members. 

Dentistry, also known as Dental and Oral Medicine, is a branch of medicine that consists of the study,
diagnosis, prevention, and treatment of diseases, disorders, and conditions of the oral cavity. Dentists
diagnose and treat dental issues and help patients develop better oral hygiene regimens. They clean
teeth, correct bite issues, perform surgeries and extractions and perform other duties to ensure that the
teeth and mouth are healthy.

Dr. Jackson resides in Mayfield Village with his wife of 13 years, Beckki, and their son, Austin. In his
spare time, he enjoys traveling, scuba diving, watching baseball (Cleveland Indians), coaching baseball
and ice hockey, as well as cooking. His favorite color is blue and his favorite food is crab legs or maybe
a steak. His favorite music is rock and roll and his favorite band is Guns N’ Roses.

Learn More about Dr. Brian E. Jackson:

Through his findatopdoc profile, https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2637496-Brian-Jackson-Dentist or
through Brian Jackson Dental, http://brianjacksondental.com/team_member/brian-e-jackson/

About FindaTopDoc.com

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide you on your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know-how to make informed decisions for you and your family. 
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