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Mitchell C. Shultz, MD, Ophthalmologist with Shultz Chang
Get to know Ophthalmologist Dr. Mitchell C. Shultz, who serves patients in Northridge,
California. 



Issuewire
www.Issuewire.com

New York City, Sep 21, 2019 (Issuewire.com)  -  Dr. Shultz is an ophthalmologist serving patients in
Northridge and the surrounding communities. He is affiliated with Shultz Chang – a practice dedicated
to excellent service offering LASIK, laser cataract surgery, cataract implant options, BOTOX and eyelid
cosmetic treatments, eye exams, and treatment for dry eye and glaucoma. 

Dr. Shultz earned his Medical Degree (MD) from New York Medical College in 1992. He went on to
complete and internship at UCLA and his residency in ophthalmology at the University of California
Irvine. He completed a fellowship in refractive surgery at Instituto Zaldivar and in oculoplastic surgery
under David Tenzel, MD, in Miami, Florida. 

Dr. Shultz is a fellow of the American Academy of Ophthalmology (AAO), the American Society of
Cataract and Refractive Surgery (ASCR), and the International Society of Refractive Surgery (ISRS).
The AAO is the world’s largest association of eye physicians and surgeons. A global community of
32,000 medical doctors, they protect sight and empower lives by setting the standards for ophthalmic
education and advocating for their patients and the public. 

Ophthalmology is a branch of medicine and surgery which deals with the diagnosis and treatment of eye
disorders. As an ophthalmologist, Dr. Shultz can diagnose and treat diseases, perform eye operations
and prescribe eyeglasses and contacts. He regularly conducts clinical studies as well as FDA-regulated
investigations on the latest innovations in the field including: PermaVision, Custom Cornea and
Wavefront LASIK, Hyperopic LASIK, Multifocal Cataract Surgery, Wavefront Cataract Surgery, Intacs,
and the Verisysw Phakic IOL. 

With over 20 years of experience in the field, Dr. Shultz has treated thousands of patients. Having
undergone LASIK himself, Dr. Shultz is uniquely qualified to counsel his patients from both their
perspective and that of an accomplished surgeon. 

Learn More about Dr. Mitchell C. Shultz: 

Through his findatopdoc profile, https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2759942-Mitchell-Shultz-
ophthalmologist-Northridge-CA-91325 or through Shultz Chang, http://www.shultz-chang.com/about-
us/our-doctors 

About FindaTopDoc.com 

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide on you your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know how to make informed decisions for you and your family. 

Media Contact

Your Health Contact

https://www.issuewire.com/
https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2759942-Mitchell-Shultz-ophthalmologist-Northridge-CA-91325
https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2759942-Mitchell-Shultz-ophthalmologist-Northridge-CA-91325
http://www.shultz-chang.com/about-us/our-doctors
http://www.shultz-chang.com/about-us/our-doctors


Issuewire
www.Issuewire.com

clientservice@yourhealthcontact.com

Source : Mitchell C. Shultz, MD

See on IssueWire : https://www.issuewire.com/mitchell-c-shultz-md-ophthalmologist-with-shultz-
chang-1645217686948044

 

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

