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Igor Igdalev, DMD, a Dentist with Tenafly Dental Spa
Get to know Dentist Dr. Igor Igdalev, who serves patients in Tenafly, New Jersey. 
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New York City, Oct 4, 2019 (Issuewire.com)  -  Dr. Igdalev is a dentist serving Tenafly and the
surrounding communities. He is affiliated with Tenafly Dental Spa – a practice focused on high-quality,
painless family dentistry. A family-oriented practise, Tenafly Dental Spa provides dentistry starting from
pediatrics to grown adults. Whether it’s a child’s first dental cleaning or an unexpected toothache, each
patient is catered to based on his or her individual needs. Dr. Igdalev earned his Doctor of Dental
Medicine from Rutgers School of Dental Medicine.

In order to remain up to date in his field, Dr. Igdalev maintains a professional membership with the
American Dental Association, the New Jersey Dental Association, and the American Academy of
Cosmetic Dentistry. The New Jersey Dental Association was founded in 1870 and is one of New
Jersey's oldest professional associations. They serve and support its members and fosters the
advancement of quality, ethical oral healthcare for the public. 

Dentistry is a branch of medicine that consists of the study, diagnosis, prevention, and treatment of
diseases, disorders, and conditions of the oral cavity. As a dentist, Dr. Igdalev is trained to carry out
such treatment as professional cleaning, restorative, prosthodontic, and endodontic procedures, and
performing examinations. 

During his time in the field, Dr. Igdalev has treated countless patients. He gives back to the community
at large by going on dental mission trips to Costa Rica and volunteering for Habitat for Humanity. 

Learn More about Dr. Igor Igdalev: 

Through his findatopdoc profile, https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/1400680-Igor-Igdalev-Dentist or
through Tenafly Dental Spa, https://www.tenaflydentalspa.com/meet-dr-igor-jerry-igdalev 

About FindaTopDoc.com 

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide you on your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know-how to make informed decisions for you and your family.  
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Source : Igor Igdalev, DMD

See on IssueWire : https://www.issuewire.com/igor-igdalev-dmd-a-dentist-with-tenafly-dental-
spa-1646396099374107
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