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Karen C. Rosenspire, MD, PhD, a Radiologist 
Get to know Radiologist Dr. Karen C. Rosenspire, who serves patients in Philadelphia,
Pennsylvania.
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New York City, Jan 1, 2020 (Issuewire.com)  -  Dr. Rosenspire is a board-certified radiologist who
currently serves as an Assistant Professor of Clinical Radiology at the Department of Radiology/
Division of Nuclear Medicine and Clinical Molecular Imaging at the Perelman School of Medicine at the
University of Pennsylvania in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania.

The Perelman School of Medicine at the University of Pennsylvania consistently ranks among the top
five in US News and World Report’s rankings of research-oriented medical schools. Its mission is to
advance knowledge and improve health through research, patient care, and the education of trainees in
an inclusive culture that embraces diversity fosters innovation, stimulates critical thinking, supports
lifelong learning, and sustains the University’s legacy of excellence.

After earning her Bachelor of Arts degree in Chemistry and Biology from Eastern College in St. Davids,
Pennsylvania, Dr. Rosenspire went on to obtain her Doctorate degree in Biophysics from the State
University of New York at Buffalo in 1980. 19 years later, in 1999, she earned her medical degree from
the Wayne State School of Medicine in Detroit, Michigan. The doctor’s postgraduate training
encompassed an internship and a residency in radiology at Henry Ford Hospital in Detroit, a fellowship
in nuclear medicine at the University of Michigan in Ann Arbor, as well as a fellowship in women’s
imaging at Henry Ford Hospital. 

Following her education, she became board-certified in diagnostic radiology by the American Board of
Radiology, which is a non-profit physician-led organization that oversees the certification and ongoing
professional development of specialists in diagnostic radiology, radiation oncology, and medical
physics. She also became board-certified in nuclear medicine by the American Board of Nuclear
Medicine, which certifies physicians as specialists in the practice of nuclear medicine.

Radiology is a medical specialty that uses medical imaging to diagnose and treat diseases within the
human body. Radiologists are medical doctors who specialize in diagnosing and treating injuries and
diseases using medical imaging procedures, such as exams and tests, X-rays, computed tomography,
magnetic resonance imaging, nuclear medicine, mammography, positron emission tomography, and
ultrasound.

Learn More about Dr. Karen C. Rosenspire:

Through her findatopdoc profile,
https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2812164-Karen-Rosenspire-Radiologist or through the Perelman
School of Medicine at the University of Pennsylvania, 
https://www.med.upenn.edu/apps/faculty/index.php/g275/p8923735

About FindaTopDoc.com

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide you on your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know-how to make informed decisions for you and your family. 

https://www.issuewire.com/
https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/2812164-Karen-Rosenspire-Radiologist
https://www.med.upenn.edu/apps/faculty/index.php/g275/p8923735


Issuewire
www.Issuewire.com

Media Contact

Your Health Contact

clientservice@yourhealthcontact.com

Source : Karen C. Rosenspire, MD, PhD

See on IssueWire

 

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

https://www.issuewire.com/karen-c-rosenspire-md-phd-a-radiologist-1654447061509950
http://www.tcpdf.org

