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Mobile Sports Game Boxing Star’s ‘Fight Club Battle’ Beta
Update 
Fight to become the strongest Fight Club in the game!

Seoul, Jan 17, 2020 (Issuewire.com)  -  Publisher and mobile game developer FourThirtyThree Inc.
(4:33) today unveiled the Beta Update of Boxing Star’s highly anticipated ‘Fight Club Battle’ mode. Fight
Clubs (Clans) will now have the chance to face off against each other in Fight Club Battles and fight to
become the strongest Fight Club in the game!

During the Beta period, Fight Club Leaders can simply click ‘Apply’ to enroll their Fight Club in the ‘Fight
Club Battle’ Beta. Once the ‘Fight Club Battle’ begins, players will have a day to prepare for the fight.
During the Prep Time, players can upgrade their Fight Club Sponsor Levels with Fight Club members to
gain extra game abilities that can be used only in Fight Club Battle. Then, they will have one day to test
their mettle against other Fight Club members. Once the fight begins, the Fight Club that achieves a
higher score will win the battle. Rewards for both single battle gameplay and performance throughout
the entire season will be up for grabs to all Fight Clubs that participate.

In addition to allowing the players to try out the new mode, ‘Fight Club Battle’ Beta will also offer them a
chance to be involved in its development process. Players will be able to express their opinions and
suggestions about the mode, which the developers are planning to take into consideration during their
preparations for the mode’s grand launch.
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Boxing Star’s Lunar New Year's Mission Event was also announced today, with heaps of in-game items
revealed as rewards. Those who complete missions such as Gym Training and other in-game missions
can get their hands on these great items. On top of that, players can continue to dance to “Square Up”,
the winning song in Boxing Star’s Hip-Hop Soundtrack Contest, which can be heard in the Fight Club
Battle Lounge.

Developed by 4:33, Boxing Star features an immersive story and interactive gameplay in which players
fight through multiple tournaments. The gameplay is optimized for the mobile experience and offers
simple touch, tap, and swipe controls.

For more details on the most recent update, go to Boxing Star’s Official Facebook Page.
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