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Kimberly Marasco releases Fallen from Grace which is based
on her inspirational life-story
Title published by Ukiyoto Publishing in September 2019

Fort Pierce, Feb 3, 2020 ( Issuewire.com) - Fallen from Grace touches on themes of adversity, love,
loss, illness, strength and perseverance. It was written during a time when Kimberly Marasco confronted
adversity in both education and work environments. She describes how she was offered a really great
job working in the recruiting industry only to find out how shady and cut-throat the business really was.
Lady Gaga sang a song titled, Shallow. The events Kim discusses greatly fit the connotation of shallow
in its entirety. The shallow times only became worse after she tried defending herself and standing up
for her rights. She describes how undue stress contributed to a debilitating illness that made her life a
living hell for many months.

Kim could not work or do barely anything as there were many symptoms associated with having a
vestibular disorder. She discusses what she did to get better and the book sheds light on many sensitive
issues that have remained in the dark for too long. Many people tried to silence and discredit her.
However, the truth is nonetheless true and the book serves as her voice. It is her hope that the book will
help others avoid the same traps she fell for and encourage positive change so that all can live healthy
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and stress-free lives.

Kimberly Marasco has a bachelor degree in history and a master's in business. Prior to publishing,
Fallen From Grace with Ukiyoto Publishing in September 2019 she wrote a screenplay for a possible
film adaptation. The impetus that drove her to publish her book came to fruition when she gained her
strength back after falling ill to a debilitating stress-related illness brought on by undue stress that she
encountered for several years. However, after she published her book, many people tried to silence and
discredit her but she never gave up the perilous fight and ultimately had her voice heard.

While we were discussing with Kim about what drove her to write the book, she said, “I believe many
people will find my material relatable as we all confront some type of adversity or hardships throughout
our lives. My hope is for others who have been marginalized due to their differences know that they are
significant and have the power to encourage change for a better society where everyone is treated fairly
and given a voice. We must work together to make change happen.”

“I hope to increase awareness about vestibular disorders as they are triggered by stress and how we
need to encourage the progression of democracy to live healthier lives,” Kim says.

Fallen From Grace has already received a lot of positive feedback from the time of its launch and has
been showcased to more than twenty-five thousand bookstores and retail chains across the globe for
taking up and placing a copy at their stores. As true stories and inspirational stories always find a way to
people’s heart providing them with the much-needed hope and motivation to fight their own battles, few
stores have taken up the copies on consignment basis while rest are in invigilation mode to place them
and start selling. The title has also been made available on Ingram for wholesale purchase by stores and
retailers.

Kim hopes to have her book sold in bookstores around the globe especially at stores such as Barnes
and Noble and also plans to send few copies for preview to some stores for consideration and keeping
on their shelves.

There is also a beautiful video promo of her title, Fallen From Grace, available on Youtube.

For bookstores and wholesalers, the title is available for purchase at wholesale rate on Ingram.

#bestsellers #amazon #books #authors #writers #inspiration #motivation #truestory #nonfiction
#getyourcopy #motivation #inspiration #getyourcopy #amwriting #writingcommunity #getpublished
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