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Jorge Paez, DDS, a Dentist with Nevada Dental Esthetics
Get to know Dentist Dr. Jorge Paez, who serves patients in Las Vegas, Nevada.

New York City, Oct 15, 2020 (Issuewire.com)  -  Dr. Paez is a Las Vegas dentist serving Summerlin,
Spring Valley, and nearby Nevada locations at Nevada Dental Esthetics. Since opening the practice in
1999, he has been committed to delivering the highest standards of dental care using the latest
cosmetic dentistry techniques.

“It’s not enough to just meet people’s expectations; you have to exceed them. That’s a commitment I
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made to myself years ago, and it remains the foundation of my practice today. Nothing can replace the
value of building a relationship with the people you serve” expressed Dr. Paez.

Never settling for less than the best, this has been his guiding philosophy since he began his dentistry
career, and is one he has never abandoned. He pursues the most advanced dental technology and
techniques with the highest safety profiles so that his patients can always walk away satisfied. He can
perform any dental procedure a patient needs in order to achieve or maintain the smile that they have
always wanted.

Before embarking on his professional journey, Dr. Paez graduated with his Doctor of Dental Surgery
degree from the Boyne School of Dentistry at Creighton University in 1995. He then went on to further
his training at the Las Vegas Institute for Advanced Dental Studies, which is considered one of the best
schools for postgraduate cosmetic dentistry training.

Continuously driving dentistry forward, he is a member of the American Academy of Cosmetic Dentistry,
the Academy of Laser Dentistry, the Southern Nevada Dental Society, the American Academy of Dental
Sleep Medicine, and the American Dental Association. In addition, he is an active participant in
continuing education course work in new cosmetic dentistry techniques and methodologies, as well as
training to treat sleep apnea.

Dentistry, also known as Dental and Oral Medicine, is a branch of medicine that consists of the study,
diagnosis, prevention, and treatment of diseases, disorders, and conditions of the oral cavity. Dentists
diagnose and treat dental issues and help patients develop better oral hygiene regimens. They clean
teeth, correct bite issues, perform surgeries and extractions and perform other duties to ensure that the
teeth and mouth are healthy. 

Learn More about Dr. Jorge Paez:

Through his findatopdoc profile, https://www.findatopdoc.com/doctor/3212301-Jorge-Paez-Dentist or
through Nevada Dental Esthetics, https://www.lasvegas-cosmetic-dentistry.com/meet-dr-jorge-paez 

About FindaTopDoc.com

FindaTopDoc is a digital health information company that helps connect patients with local physicians
and specialists who accept your insurance. Our goal is to help guide you on your journey towards
optimal health by providing you with the know-how to make informed decisions for you and your family. 
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