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Heath Refinishing- Best Furniture Repair Shop in Texas
Furniture Repair Shop

Texas, Frisco, Jun 14, 2021 (Issuewire.com)  -  Heath Refinishing is one of the best furniture repair
companies in Texas. Heath Refinishing is a family-owned company and they had a passion for
woodworking. The company is providing furniture services such as refinishing, repairing, or custom
furniture building. When the customer tries to contact the company they can talk directly with the person
who actually does furniture restoration and not with the sales rep. You can also get a free and no-
obligation quote on refinishing your furniture.                             

Work of Heath refinishing:

At Heath Refinishing they try to maintain an equal quality of craftsmanship for an affordable price. To
deliver a quality job they deeply observe the piece of furniture to choose the best method to recover the
natural beauty of the furniture. Heath Refinishing does not cover the damages on the furniture instead of
that they will repair the wood itself by removing the old or damaged finish.

Process followed by Heath Refinishing:

Removal of old finishes cannot be possible without the necessary equipment and knowledge. The
process followed by the company to make an old antique piece into a new one is stripping, fixing,
sanding, staining, and finishing. A cutting-edge system involves several steps. The first step is to
remove and clean hardware, and then by using the Flow-over system all surfaces are chemically
stripped to remove existing finish and stain without damaging the wood, veneer, or glue. Next, to remove
stripper residue all surfaces are rinsed with power water.

The next step is sanding which is the most important step in furniture refinishing. In Heath Refinishing
sanding process is done by hand to prevent the swirl marks and irregular sanding patterns which are left
behind in electric sanders. The next step is the staining process, in the staining process, they only use
the top-of-the-line dye which penetrates into the wood surface to give natural beauty to the wood. Dye
stains have a long lifetime and that will give beauty to the furniture for many years.

About Heath Refinishing:

Heath refinishing was founded by Steven Heath. The company is providing high-quality service and also
exceeds customer expectations. They handle the furniture with care by the thing it as their own object.
The customer will get satisfied with their service and pay a competitive prices. Apart from complete
refinishing, they are also providing services to all types of furniture. For more details about Heath
Refinishing kindly visit https://heathrefinishing.com/
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