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Gary Blom – Seasoned Businessman and Entrepreneur 
Gary Blom is an experienced entrepreneur & executive who has held different high positions
at several organizations in Australia and the USA.

Sydney, New South Wales Oct 21, 2022 (Issuewire.com)  -  Gary Blom is an experienced
entrepreneur & executive who has held different high positions at several organizations in Australia and
the USA. His career and experience of being a businessman span over 30 years. He has various vital
skills which include finance, sales, marketing, and strategic planning. And all of this has really helped
him to build a successful career. He has played vital roles at various top property companies and
organizations. He's currently an executive chairman at National Property Group  Limited and a director
at Main Street Capital.  National Property Group was formed in 2020 whilst being a director of Main
Street Capital since 2008. 

Main Street Capital headquartered in Sydney Australia, is a financial advisory firm that provides
financial advisory and capital raising services for Australian and New Zealand companies wanting to
enter the U.S market. He has been in the organization for over fourteen years and has assisted a large
number of Australian companies in accessing U.S capital markets. Overall, these years have been
marked with various strides and achievements, helping over 40 companies during Gary Blom’s tenure. 

Gary Blom’s experience at the companies and businesses he has started and worked at, has helped
him to build an impressive of resume of successful ventures.  With over 30 years of being in the
business world, Gary Blom has had to deal with many different people, businesses, sectors, and all the
challenges that with starting and growing new companies. 

In 1986 Gary Blom founded Corporate Capital Group headquartered in New York, the USA  where he
was managing partner for 8 years. The primary focus of CCG was to help companies from Australia and
New Zealand enter the U.S markets. One of the highlights of Gary’s time with CCG was forming a joint
venture with the world’s 9th largest accounting firm at the time Laventhal and Horwath. This group was
chosen as a financial advisor to Austrade in order to assist with the strategic planning of companies in
Australia. 

Currently, Gary Blom is the Executive Chairman of National Property Group in New South Wales,
Australia. The company seeks to ease the stress of making decisions about properties. Established in
2020, the company provides agents and other property professionals with valuable data that can
influence property decisions. Gary Blom is known for being a great leader to his 30 staff. Constantly
encouraging them, and ensuring a positive work culture. Gary Blom takes charge of all things
concerning business and marketing. This includes - marketing, sale, strategy, networking, negotiation,
management, and importantly, getting to know the clients' needs and also giving professional advice
concerning mergers.

 All this allows the companies or organizations he works at to achieve success. For example, working at
Main Street Capital, the company has been able to; Assist a new e-commerce outlet by raising capital to
help finance their next stage of business growth, develop a mutual planning alliance with a few high-
quality street investment banks, counsel the owners of a mining services firm that generates more than
hundred million dollars ($100m) in yearly revenues on how to structure debt ensuing the stopping of two
of their substantial mining contract. 

He also founded the Corporate Capital Group where he was the managing director for eight years
(1986-1994). He established this business to help companies in New Zealand and Australia who
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wanted to establish operations in the United States of America (USA). This business under his
leadership really prospered as the business and financial objectives were met and exceeded within just
three years.  Also, this Corporate Capital Group was chosen as a financial advisor to Austrade in New
York to help in the strategic planning for important Australian industries.
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