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Introducing Hally AI: Revolutionizing Recruiting with
Advanced Generative AI

Knutsford, Cheshire Apr 20, 2023 (Issuewire.com)  -  Hally AI, a cutting-edge generative AI
company, is proud to announce its launch with over 50 task templates to transform the way recruiters
streamline their recruiting process. Hally AI's innovative technology is designed to assist recruiters with
various tasks such as writing job adverts, sending emails, social media posts, and resume parsing,
saving them time and effort while maximizing their recruiting potential.

Recruiting has always been a complex and time-consuming process, but Hally AI aims to change that
with its advanced generative AI technology. Hally AI's platform comes equipped with over 50 task
templates that cover all aspects of the recruiting process, ensuring that recruiters have a comprehensive
solution to meet all their recruiting needs.

Hally AI's platform is designed to be user-friendly, making it accessible to recruiters of all levels of
technical expertise. Recruiters can easily choose from a wide range of task templates, including job
advert writing, email drafting, social media post creation, and resume parsing, to streamline their
recruitment process and enhance their productivity.

Other features include a job advert rewriter, a corporate text remover, a job skills extractor, and a job
description parser, with the latter allowing recruiters to quickly identify the relevant details in long job
description documents.

Meanwhile, the company says that its job text bias analyzer generates inclusive, unbiased content that
ensures job descriptions and job adverts are free of gender, race, and other biases, allowing recruiters
to attract a more diverse pool of candidates.

With Hally AI, recruiters can expect to experience increased efficiency, improved candidate
engagement, and enhanced recruitment outcomes. By automating repetitive tasks and leveraging the
power of generative AI, recruiters can focus on building relationships with candidates, identifying top
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talent, and making more informed hiring decisions.

To learn more about Hally AI and its revolutionary generative AI technology for recruiters, visit hally.ai

About Hally AI:

Hally AI is a leading generative AI company that specializes in revolutionizing the recruiting process.
With over 50 task templates covering job advert writing, email drafting, social media post creation, and
resume parsing, Hally AI empowers recruiters to streamline their recruitment efforts and achieve better
outcomes. With its user-friendly platform and state-of-the-art generative AI technology, Hally AI is
poised to transform the way recruiters work and improve their overall efficiency and effectiveness.

Contact Information:

Rosie Quinn, Hally AI Email: rosie@hally.ai Website: hally.ai
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