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Tournament in Puerto Rico

San Juan, Puerto Rico Apr 26, 2023 (Issuewire.com)  -  Frankie Lozada, the underdog Democratic
presidential candidate, has taken a break from the campaign trail to compete in the first-ever USAPA-
sanctioned pickleball tournament in Puerto Rico. Frankie, who spends most of his time as a community
activist, believes that pickleball is an amazing way to connect with the youth and bring communities
together.

This tournament is of huge significance., As part of his campaign promise,  Frankie Lozada plans to
pass the act that he calls the SAVE Democracy Act, which stands for Secondary American Voting
Expansion. Currently, residents of commonwealths and territories cannot vote in federal elections
despite falling under United States regulations. This act would grant all American citizens the right to
vote for president, Puerto Rico being the territory with the highest population of over 3 million
Americans.

Frankie's campaign has been gaining momentum recently, with his unique vision for a better future for
all Americans. When elected, he would be both the first Latino and youngest president elected, and he is
not afraid to take on the establishment to fight for what he believes in.

Despite the hectic nature of the campaign trail, Frankie has made time for his passion for pickleball. He
believes that the sport is a great way to relieve stress and connect with people from all walks of life. As
an underdog in both the presidential race and the pickleball tournament, Frankie knows that the odds
are stacked against him. However, he remains confident that he can achieve great things both on and
off the court.
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Speaking about his love for the sport, Frankie said, "Pickleball is more than just a game to me. It's a way
to connect with people and build strong communities. Whether I'm on the campaign trail or the court, I'm
always looking for ways to bring people together."

Frankie's campaign website, Frankie4us.com, has been buzzing with excitement since he announced
his participation in the pickleball tournament. Supporters from across the country have been sending
messages of encouragement and support, with many saying that they are excited to see Frankie in
action both on and off the court.

As the first-ever USAPA-sanctioned pickleball tournament in Puerto Rico gets underway, all eyes will be
on Frankie Lozada. Whether he wins or loses, there is no doubt that he will continue to fight for a better
future for all Americans.
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