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Marilyn Cordova-Winchell, Recognized by BestAgents.us as a
2023 Top Agent
Marilyn is a trusted resource guiding clients through the complex world of real estate. 

New York City, New York Jun 7, 2023 (Issuewire.com)  -  Representing buyers, sellers and investors,
Marilyn is a licensed realtor at Keller Williams Louisville East in Louisville, Kentucky. Her goal is to assist
clients throughout their transaction, representing their best interest from negotiations to contract
execution. 
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The team of highly-seasoned real estate professionals working at Keller Williams Louisville East
understand that buying or selling a home is more than just a transaction: it’s a life-changing experience.
That’s why they are dedicated to providing exceptional, personalized service for all of their clients. They
take great pride in the relationships they build and always work relentlessly on the client’s behalf to help
them achieve their real estate goals.

With an impressive educational background, Marilyn graduated with her Associate of Arts and Science
degree in Radio and Television Broadcasting Technology/Technician from the University of Puerto Rico,
Arecibo in 1989. After spending a year abroad to study communications at Saint Louis University -
Madrid Campus, she went on to earn her Bachelor of Science degree in Journalism from Salem State
University.

Marilyn first came to Louisville in 2003. She moved to Fairfax, Virginia for a few years but moved back to
be close to family. She has published articles in Landmark Community Newspapers of Kentucky, and
has served five different boards and councils while she has lived in Louisville as she enjoys giving back
to the community.

Attributing her success to her attitude of learning and curiosity, as well as the expertise of those ahead
of her, Marilyn found great mentors getting started at Keller Williams and fell in love with real estate
helping others make their dreams come true.

Having lived in 5 different countries, she can really help the international community. Her gift for
language is an asset to her field, speaking English, Spanish, and Serbo-Croatian. 

Learn More about Marilyn Cordova-Winchell:

Through her Best Agent’s profile, https://bestagents.us/profile.php?agent=2120281 or through Keller
Williams Louisville East, https://www.kwlouisvilleeast.com/meet-the-team/

About Best Agents

Best Agents recognizes the top real estate professionals across the nation to help buyers, sellers, and
investors match with the most qualified agents in their area. Best Agent's comprehensive database of
real estate professionals features agents by local expertise, verified licenses, transaction history and
specializations to make sure that consumers are provided with the highest level of knowledge, seamless
end-to-end service and transparency in the buying and selling process.
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